To:
Richard Kahn

From: jeffrey E.

Sent: Wed 5/10/2017 9:20:36 PM

Subject: Re:

ok

On Wed, May 10, 2017 at 5:18 PM, wrote:

Below text f‘mm.. Please advise.

Hi -Imw are u? I hope all is good. Writing to you because Jeffrey told me to organize with
you regarding payment for my summer courses. They are due on Friday and are $3500. Would
you like to see the bill? We can do either way either u pay straight to school or transfer to me
and I pay both works fin¢ for me! Also wondering if we could book a Fekkai appointment
Friday morning by any chance?

Sent from my 1Phone
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