
To: Kevin 0uvre[ 
From: MfMf 
Sent Thur 5/18/2017 7:50:26 PM 
Subject Re: Firsrt situation 

HI Kevin...wanted to let you know our accounting department has wired you the 50%..you can 
expect to see it in your acct early next week. 
take care, Lesley 

On May 17, 2017, at 12:19 AM, Kevin Ouvre ala.> wrote: 

Hi Lesley, 

Please find enclosed a first situation representing 50% of the plain amount. Indeed 
following my meeting with Jeffrey I need to work on details as US code and 
refined details. The full amount shall be charged when its done after a new meeting 
with jeffrey. 

Thank you very much, 

Kevin. 
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