
To: 
From: gie a um 
Sent Fri 5/19/2017 7:20:28 PM 
Subject Re: INVOICE 5/18 + 5/19 

Yes - she made the appt when she left on the Ilth, also when she purchased the products. 
Anytime for Jeffrey, of course! 

Best, 

Angie 

©dangene 
Dangene: The Institute of Skinovation 
66 E 55th Street, 6th Floor 
Between Park and Madison 
South Side of the Street 
Ncw York, NY 10022 

On May 19, 2017, at 3:18 PM, wrote: 

Did Julia see you again on May 18th (yesterday)? I made her a facial appointment 
for May Ilth...but am unaware of the May 18th visit? I did receive the invoice for 
the products (thanks!) 
...thank you again for fitting Jeffrey in today... 

On Ma 19 2017 at 3:05 PM, Angie Palumbo 
wrote: 

Happy Friday! Attached, please find the invoice for the sessions used this 
week. I sent a separate one (from our square) for the product charge, 
please advise if you got it, I will resend if not! 

Best, 

Angie 

@dangene 
Dangene: The Institute of Skinovation 
66 E. 55th Street, 6th Floor 
Between Park and Madison 
South Side of Street 
New York, NY 10022 
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