To:
From:
Sent:
Subject:

zeia il [

Lesley Gro

Thur 5/18/2017 8:13:05 PM

Fwd: Products for Julia at Dangene's -OK to Pay for them?

I will give them JE's amex for processing

Ok

Begin forwarded message:

From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Products for Julia at Dangene's -OK to Pay for them?
Date: May 18, 2017 at 4:12:11 PM EDT

Tos Lesiey Grof
On Thu, May 18, 2017 at 3:56 PM Lesley Gmﬁ‘_ wrote:

OK to pay for the $187.26 for pmduct-hﬂs purchased from Dangene?!

Begin forwarded messgog:
From: Ap ointment_

Subject: products
Date: May 18, 20
To: Lesley Groff
Cc: Appointment

Hi Lesley,

-waz given two products today totaling $5187.26, may we have the
payment method you'd like to charge these to?

Best,

Angie

@dangene

Dangene: The Institute of Skinovation
66 E. 55th Street, 6th Floor

Between Park and Madison

South Side of Street
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please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 15 the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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