
To: Bella Klein 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Tue 5/30/2017 2:15:48 PM 
Subject: Re: Make sure the Marrakech Hotel does not get charged to JE's card 

good deal. thanks 

> On May 30, 2017, at 10:12 AM, Bella Klein < > wrote: 

> so far don't see any charges from this hotel, Charge might be under a different 
name. Will check every charge when statement is received June 11th.. 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 

> • Tel: 

» On May 30, 2017, at 10:06 AM, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 
>> 
>> Bella, please keep an eye out and make sure the hotel in Marrakech does not 
also ding Jeffrey's Amex-we thought it was all taken care of for 
>> 
» Kenzi Farah Hotel 

stay May 21-29. 

EFTA_R1_00938872 

EFTA02213665


