
To: 
Fnxn: 
Sent: 
Subject: 

Lesley Groff 
Mon 5/29/2017 4:30:47 PM 
Re: Hotel marrakech 

Great. Thank you! 
I'll get back to you tomorrow. So sorry you had to pay on way out. We will get it 
sorted out. 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On May 29, 2017, at 12:18 PM, wrote: 

> This is the invoice 
> <imagel.JPG> 

> <image2.JPG> 

> Envoye de mon iPhone 

>> Le 29 mai 2017 A 17:26, Lesley Groff < a ecrit : 

>> Oh my gosh! I filled out the 3rd party credit card authorization form and 
faxed to them. Let me see if I can reach my Amex representative and have them 
call to straighten out. This may have to happen tomorrow however as it is 
Memorial Day in the US and people have the day off. 

EFTA_R1_00939139 

EFTA02213742


