From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Mon 6/5/2017 4:43:41 PM

Subject: Re: Can we VOID ticket for-m San Di ego? ((Rec. Lc:c»‘-]

ok nice...
thanks

On Jun 5, 2017, at 12:43 PM, Natalia Molotkova

And with jet Blue we can use credit fro any name, doesn't matter. Change fee of 150.00 would be applied. D
Regards,

Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon, Wed 9a-4p, 530p-7p
Tue, Thur, Fri 9a - 530p EST

ok sounds good...thanks

On Jun 5, 2017, at 12:32 PM, Natalia Molotkova _ wrote:

Ok, | can void ticket we issued on Friday (for tomorrow), but return was issued on May 31st, so it will be crec

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon, Wed 9a-4p, 530p-7p
Tue, Thur, Fri9a - 530p EST

void as well...doesn't appear Jeffrey will be going...or at least not having her go...
he is still on the fence!
but -wiil not go or return.. .thank you for asking!! ;)

On Jun 5, 2017, at 12:27 PM, Natalia Molotkova _wmte:

What about return? On June 8th?

Regards,
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Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon, Wed 9a-4p, 530p-7p
Tue, Thur, Fri 9a - 230p EST

On it...

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

ours: Mon, Wed 9a-dp, p
Tue, Thur, Fri9a - 530p EST

Hi Natasha...is it possible to void the ticket we have 1‘0_0 go to San Diego tomorrow?

(Rec. LocRERPJDND)
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