To:
From:
Sent:
Subject:

[ just re

Lesley Groff
Wed 5/31/2017 3:25:10 PM

Re: Ticket for -

¢"d the new ticket with a seat for her on the outbound! thank you!

On May 31, 2017, at 11:13 AM, Natalia Molotkova

| though | got her seat, let me have a look.

Regards,
Matalia (Natasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon, Wed 9a-4p, 530p-/p
Tue, Thur, Fri 9a - 530p EST

| see we don't have a seat for -un her outbound flight...are they under airport control? Do we have to pu

On May 31, 2017, at 9:36 AM, Natalia Mﬂiﬂthwa_wrute:

wow! Me tool!!! thank you!

On May 31, 2017, at 9:36 AM, Natalia Molotkova _ wrote:

| am so glad | issued ticket last night, fare today is $968.10. We issued at 634.10, fare is non refundable, cha

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

!DUFEI Hun. !E! !a!p, !!!p-lp

Tue, Thur, Fri 9a - 530p EST

Yes

Sent from my iPhone

On May 30, 2017, at 5:23 PM, Natalia Mﬂiﬂtkuva_wmte:
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Lesley, fare went up to $634.10. Still Ok to issue or look for cheaper option?

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

ours: ivon ed va

; =5 B
Tue, Thur, Fri 9a - 530p EST

Hi Natasha. Please issue below fur-

One way connectin

TOTAL FARE - USD 44410

Sent from my iPhone
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