
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: Bella Klei 
From: Lesley Gro 
Sent Thur 5/25/2017 9:07:42 PM 
Subject Re: gift for Larry's daughters wedding? 

Fantastic! Thank you®!!! 

‹ >On May 25, 2017, at 5:02 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

yes already taken care of by bella 
bella can you please give details on what was bought from tiffany and paid by HBRK 
we will include you on card as well.. 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 

On May 25, 2017, at 4:49 PM 
wrote: 

HI Rich...Larry's daughter, Taylor, is getting married at the ranch on June 3rd 
(which I'm sure you know)....should we get a gift for her from the 
office? I know we don't know Taylor, but we do know Larry...I'm 
not really sure how it should work...? Just wanted to throw it out 
there... 
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