
To: Lesley Grof 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Tue 6/20/2017 1:20:42 PM 
Subject: Re: CC Authorization form for 

i am calling credit card... hold on 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Jun 20, 2017, at 9:20 AM, Lesley Groff 

(plus other documents) 

wrote: 

Bella. Can you please help here? I don't know 
what is wrong. I've been trying to get this done 
for days now. 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)" 

Date: June 20, 2017 at 9:09:49 AM EDT 
To: Lesley Groff 
Cc: Bella Klein 
Subject: RE: CC Authorization form for 

(plus other 
documents) 

Dear Lesley, 
No payment is received from the card. Not accepted. 

Best Regards 

EFTA_R1_00943832 
EFTA02215627



Rixos Premium Belek 
Elif Ceylan 

Reservation Manager 
Mobile : 

From: Lesley aToii 
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 3:39 PM 
To: Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek) 
Cc: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: CC Authorization form for 

documents) 
(plus other 

On Jun 20 2017 at 8:33 AM Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels -
!kick) wrote: 

Dear Lesley, 

Please write total amount to form. 

Best Regards 

Belk Itahallesi Kahan) Candi 
Belt* /Serie Mt 

Phone: •90 (24'; 
Fax: •90 (24: 

htto:theva 
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Rixos Premium Belek 

Elif Ceylan 

Reservation Manager 

Mobile : 

Belck 1.1ahallesi Kongre Caddi 
Belek 'Seek Antalya Turkey 

Phone:

Fax: 

http rwww mos corn 

From: Lesley Groff [r_TiNtp_ l] 
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 3:30 PM 
To: Sebla Soydan (Rixos Hotels - CHQ); Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek) 
Cc: Bella Klein 
Subject: CC Authorization form for (plus other 

documents) 

This communication contains information from Rixos Hotel Company that may bo 
confidential. Except for personal use by the intended recipient. or as expressly 
authorized by the sender. any person who receives this information is prohibited from 
disclosing. copying. distributing. and/or using it If you have received this 
communication in error. please immediately delete it and all copies. and promptly 
notify the sender. Nothing in this communication is intended to operate as an 
electronic signature under applicable law. 
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This communication contains information from Rixos Hotel Company that may be confidential. Except for personal use by 
the intended recipient, or as expressly authorized by the sender. any person who receives this 
information is prohibited from disclosing. copying. distnbuting. and/or using it. If you have received this 
communication in error. please immediately delete it and all copies. and promptly notify the sender. 
Nothing in this communication is ;Mended to operate as an electronic signature under applicable law.
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