From: arry visoskl

Sent: Wed &/7/2017 12:24:55 PM
Subject: Re: Signature Flight Support SAN reservation for N212JE Arrival on 7 Jun 2017 10:30

Many thx,.

Y n use my amx to gurenteee if you like

(11 ii i i

Sent from my 1iPhone

On Jun 7, 2017, at 8:21 AM, _n.u-rmc:

sure!

On Jun 7, 2017, at 8:06 AM, Larry Visoski -'rotc:

Your correct, now he wants a car and driver in San Diego upon arrival to go to the
Hyatt in La Jolla, can you call Signature, I'm departing in 30 minutes
can you help?

Sent from my 1Phone

On Jun 7, 2017, at 7:48 .ﬁ.Mx_ wrote:

Hertz rental..
Confirmation

Hey Larry...1 just noticed. . .this says the car rental is for
June 7 and 8. . .but the other email you sent from
Signature Flight Support for the airplane at Signature
says departing June 9...should the car be June 9 as well?

On Jun 6, 2017_at 8:29 PM, Larry Visoski
VIote:

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Signature Fhght
Support”

EFTA_R1_00944157
EFTA02215813



<Signature, Flight Support. SAN
(@hlightbridge.com>

Date: June 6, 2017 at 8:18:39 PM EDT

To: "Larry Visoski"

Subject: Signature AN reservation for
N212JE Arrival on 7 Jun 2017
10:30

Aircraft N212JE GLF4

Arrival 7 Jun 2017 10:30
Departing 8 Jun 2017 12:00

Services

Car Rental
Hertz 583,16 - 1 day + taxes/fees visoski, Larn
{619) TE7-6T00 H3I242868ETACNTR
Full Size
Regards,
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Glenn
Signature Flight Support SAN

About FlightBridge
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