From:

Sent: Fri 6/2/2017 7:14:26 PM

Subject: Re: New Tickets for Karyna and-

ok, let me tell her..

On Jun 2, 2017, at 3:14 PM, Natalia Molotkova
WTote:

Carrier can't be bigger then 17 x 125x 8,5

Regards,
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon, Wed 9a-4p, 530p-7p
Tue, Thur, Fri 9a - 530p EST

ok...but | guess you need the specs on the cats in order to reserve? Karyna said she will get to me in a bit...
the carriers are soft sided...but that is all | have for now

On Jun 2, 2017, at 3:08 PM, Natalia Molotkova -f_rote:

Pet Jet Blue pet fee is refundable.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

ours: Mon, Wed Ya-4p, P
Tue, Thur, Fri 9a - 530p EST

Mot sure, let me check with Jet Blue.

Regards,
Matalia (Natasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

!ours: !on__ !e! !a!p, !!llplp

Tue, Thur, Fri9a - 530p EST

if we reserve the space for the 2 cats with a CC and then they dont take the flight, will we get our money bac
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we should reserve their space now. ..

On Jun 2, 2017, at 2:24 PM, Natalia Molotkova wrote:

perfect

On Jun 2, 2017, at 2:24 PM, Natalia Molotkova

Yes, we will be able to void up till Monday.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

ours: Mon, Vved Ya-4p, Daup
Tue, Thur, Fri 9a - 530p EST

you know, yes issue them and we can always void later if he decided differently..but | think he will want then

On Jun 2, 2017, at 2:16 PM, Natalia Molotkova

OK to issue tickets?

Regards,

Natalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

ours: Mon, Ved 9a-dp,
Tue, Thur, Fri 9a - 530p EST

P-/pP

| will find out!

On Jun 2, 2017, at 2:10 PM, Matalia Molotkova

wrote:;

Ok, as fro now, room fro two pets is available. Will be 100.00 per pet, will need CID number. Ok to issue? W
The weight fro pet with carrier can't be more then 20 pounds,

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
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Centurion Relationshi

ours: Mon, Wed 9a-4p,
Tue, Thur, Fri9a - 530p EST

thanks...do they have to call you back re the cats? when do you find out?

On Jun 2, 2017, at 2:02 PM, Natalia Molotkova _wmte:

On hold with Jet BLue. ..
Regards,

Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

ours: Mon, Wed 9a-dp, p-/p
Tue, Thur, Fri 9a - 530p EST

understand...below looks perfect! let me know if room for cats!

On Jun 2, 2017, at 1:56 PM, Natalia Molotkova _ wrote:

Dea it is crazy busy day, sorry fro teh delay with respond.

We can do:
B6 761 05JUN LGA PBID429P 0738P
1ADT 209.21

TOTAL FARE - USD 418.42

Checking room for cats.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Hours: Mon, Wed 9a-4p, 530p-Tp
Tue, Thur, Fri9a - 530p EST

On it.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relatinnshii Manaier
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Tue, fhur. Fri9a - 530p EST

Hi Natasha...| will be sending you all new flights we need.. first, can you please get tickets for Karyna an
from NY to PB on Monday June 5th to depart NY around Spm.

Options? :)
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