To: W_
From:

Sent: Wed &/7/2017 12:31:23 PM
Subject: Re: Signature Flight Support SAN reservation for N212JE Arrival on 7 Jun 2017 10:30

Ok, Julio at Signature wants me to call Rioml Limo.. .he won't do it...?

so | will call and set up an SUV and driver to pick up at 10:30am from San diego airport ,
Signature Aviation and drive them to La Jolla Hyatt. Driver should stay and wait for

Jeftrey.. shall I book car/driver up to 10pm? I am not sure when JE wants car for tomorrow.. |
will email him,

it is Karyna and-guing with JE.. ;)

On Jun 7, 2017, at 8:24 AM, Larry "v'is:::sl-;_ wrote:

Many thx,.

Y QU can use my amx to i urenteee it you like

Sent from my iPhone

OnJun 7, 2017, at 8:21 f‘tM_ wrote:

sure!

On Jun 7. 2017 at 8:06 AM, Larry Visoski

I o

Your correct, now he wants a car and driver in San Diego upon arrival to go
to the Hyatt in La Jolla, can yvou call Signature, I'm
departing in 30 minutes can you help?

Sent from my 1Phone

On Jun 7, 2017, at 7:48 AM ,—-.-rmc:

Hey Larry...1 just noticed. . .this says the car
rental is for June 7 and 8., but the other
email you sent from Signature Flight Support
for the airplane at Signature says departing
June 9., .should the car be June 9 as well?

On Jun 6, 2017, at 8:29 PM.,
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wWrote:

Hertz rental.,.
Confirmation

Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:

From: "Signature
Flight Support"

Date: Junc 6, 2017 at 8:18:39 PM EDT

To: "Larry Visoski" | G

Subject: Signature Flight Support SAN reservation for
N212JE Arrival
on 7 Jun 2017
10:30

Aircraft N212JE GLF4

Arrival 7 Jun 2017 10:30
Departing 8 Jun 2017 12:00
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Car Rental

Hertz $53.16 - 1 day + taxesifees wiso!
{619) TET-ET00 H32428585TBCNTR
Full Size

Click here for more details

Regards,
Glenn
Signature Flight Support SAN

About FlightBridge
Signature Flight Support is using the FlightBridge system to send you this notification. FlightBridge
aircraft operators and sendce providers. Learn more about FlightBridoe at www. flighth

This e-mail was sent lo: hjst@aol com
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