To:
From:

ixos Hotels - Belek) [
Sent:

5044
Subject: Re: w“ I confirmation Letter

Form will arrive shortly!

On Jun 20, 2017, at 7:34 AM, Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)
wrote:

Dear .

You may find the mail order form as an attachment, Please send us the form as filled out
with the following documents listed below.

* Credit card copy (both sides)
s Credit card holder’s passport

*  Any kind of documents as a proof that the related card belongs to the company
(signature copies etc.)

Thank you in advance.
Kind Regards,

Rixos Premium Belek Ihgum ;sr:ﬂu Ant

Elif Ceylan phane - <] Ji;

Reservation Ma r Fax: .':
gy RS e

EFTA_R1_00947193
EFTA02217282



From:
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 2:32 PM
To: Elif Ceylan (Ri - Bel
Subject: Re: and!h Il confirmation Letter

This link does not work...the page does not display. . states “error”... When I try
to pay from the Rixos Admin Payment notification, I receive an error there as well
after putting in the details. Not sure why this is happening? Is it possible for you
to input the information on your end? So sorry to be a bother, but I am not sure
what else to do?

On Jun 20, 2017, at 3:56 AM, Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)

o
Dear Mrs. -

Youl could pay with your credit card from
here https://vpos.rixos.com/Reservation/Reservation/Reservation.aspx .

Best Regards.

Rixos Premium Belek Belek Mahallesi Kongre Cadd

Belek /Serik Antalya Turkey
Elif Ceylan pheee - || R
Reservation Manager rax: |
Mobite - |G it i ixos com
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T

rrom: N
Sent: Monday, June 19, 201/ /:

To: Sebla Soydan (Rixos Hotels - CHQ)

Cc: Elif Ceylan (Ri - Belek
Subject: Re: and - Confirmation Letter

Importance: High

Hello Sebla and Elif. Hope you both had a nice weekend. 1 have tried
twice now to pay for the Rixos stay through the email that was sent
but I am receiving an error message. May I please provide you with

the detail for the Visa card and have you try?

Jeffrey Epstein

Visa

4856 2006 0952 4890
087

Exp 1/2018

Please let me know if you are able to charge this card for - and

stay! thank you,

{Rixos

On Jun 17, 2017 at 12:44 PM. Scbla Sovdan
Hotels - CHQ) — wrote:

Mo worries - You can submit it also later on, no problem

at all. We are looking forward to welcoming the girls.

Have a nice weekend.
BRgds

SEBLA
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Istanbul Kongre Merkezi - Darulbedal Cad. No:3 Harbive / Sisli |
Turkey

Sebla Soydan BORA p«.nm:_

Director of Chairman’s Office / PA to Chairman
M. Fettah Tamince

Rixos Headquarters

Fax: +JJi212) 373 93 02

from: [
Sent: 17 Haziran 2017 Cumartesi 19:30
To: Sebla Soydan (Rixos Hotels - CHQO)

Cc: Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek) <
Subject: Re: and

Hello Selba and Elif. Thank you for this confirmation, | will

Confirmation Letter

provide a Visa card of Jeffreys soon. Probably tomorrow. It
will be prior to the girls arrival for sure! Very grateful for all
your help.

sent from my iPhone

On Jun 17, 2017, at 7:08 AM, Sebla Soydan (Rixos Hotels - CHQ)
< = wrote:
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oear I

Enclosed you'll find the confirmation letter for
and room booking at the Rixos
Premium Belek Hotel in Antalya.

The boarding is on all inclusive system, meaning
that almost every food and beverage
consumption is included in the rate, There are
always extra service with payment such as
laundry, spa, hairdressers, some a la carte
restaurants and premium quality alcoholic
beverages etc.

My colleague Ms. Elif Ceylan who is copied to
this mail is in charge of the reservation
department and | was told that American
express is the only credit card we cannot accept
the remote payment with.

However, she'll send you a link where the
cardholder logs in and makes the payment
unless you'd like to provide Elif with another
credit card such as master or visa.

In regards with payment | kindly ask you please
to liaise directly with Elif.

Room and airport pick up is confirmed and as of
morning of the 21 of June also the training at
the Spa of The Land of Legends.

Thank you.

BRgds

SEBLA
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Rixos Headquarters

Sebla Soydan BORA

Istanbul Kongre Merkezi - Darulbedal Cad. Ne:3 Harbiye
Turkey

Phone : +JJ212) 373 82 00
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Director of Chairman's Office / PA to Chairman .
Mr.Fettah Tamince Fax: +[f§212) 373 20 02

ML . m
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This communication contains information from Rixos Hotel
Company that may be confidential. Except for personal use by the
inlended recipient, or as expressly authorized by the sander, any
person who receives this information is prohibibed from disclosing.,
copying, distributing, and/or using it If you have received this
communication in eror, please immediately delete it and all
copies, and prormptly notify the sender. Mothing in this
communication is intended to operate as an electronic signature
under applicable law

<Confirmation xls>

This communication contains information from Rixos Hotel Company that may be
confidential, Except for personal use by the intended recipsont, of as axpressly
authorized by the sender, any parson who receives this information is prohibited from
disclosing, copying. distrbuting, and/or using it If you have received this
communication in error, please immediately delete it and all copies, and prompithy
notify the sender. Nathing in this communication is Intended to operate as an
electronic signature under applicabla law

This communication contains information from Rixos Holel Company that may be confidential. Except
for parsonal use by the intended recipient, or as axprassly authorized by the sander, any person who
receives this information is prohibited from disclosing, copying, distributing, andior using it. If you have
received this communication in erar, please immadialely delete it and all coples, and prompltly nolify
the sender, Mothing in this communication is intended to operate as an electranic signature under
applicable law

This communication confains information from Rivos Hotel Company that may be confidential. Except for personal use by
the intended reciplent, or as expressly authorized by the sender, any person who recetves this information is prohibited
from disclosing. copying, distributing. and/or using it. If you have received this communication in error, please
immediately delete it and all coples, and promptly notify the sender. Mothing in this communication is intended 1o operate
as an electronic signature under applicable Law

=MAIL ORDER FORM ING.doc>
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