To:

From: Bella Klein

Sent: Tue 6/20/2017 12:18:38 PM
Subject: Re: Need to pay for hotel in Turkey

You are correct June 2018
Thank you,
Bella

On Jun 20, 2017 at 7:52 AI‘»L_* wrote:

Bella, can you confirm...the expiration date is 06/2018,..NOT 01/20187? I found the
copy of the card and it shows 067 I kept trying to pay using 01 as a date and the
card would not go through. What 1s the address associated with this card? 1 need
as soon as possible please..

On Jun 19, 2017, at 10:14 AM, Bella Klein _

Wrote:

[ think that i‘m: have it saved..

Exp 1/18 987

Thank vou,
Bella

On Jun 19, 2017, at 10:09 AM, _1'-* wrote:

Hi Bella. I need to pay for the Rixos hotel in turkey for

m‘s stay there. They do not accept amex.
ey will take a visa or Mastercard. Please give me the

details for the card you would like me to use for this stay.
Thanks!
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