To: lif iin IRixos Hotels - Belek]_]

From:
Sent: Tue @20/2017 12:37:48 PM

Subject: Re: CC Authorization form for || | | | | NG ¢ I I (2'us other documents)

| wasn’t sure what to type in as they will have some incidentals.? Should I just write in the total
for room..the 5.230,00 EUR?

On Jun 20, 2017, at 838 AM, Elf Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)
<Elf. > wWrote:
vear [

Please write total amount to form.

Best Regards

Belek Mahallesi Kongre Cadde

Rixos Premium Belek Belek /Serik Anta
Elif Ceylan Phone : +JJ] (24
Reservation Manager Fax: +. (242

From: [N I
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 3:30 PM
To: Sebla Soydan (Rixos Hotels - CHQ); Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)
Cc: Bella Klein

Subject: CC Authorization form for _ & - - (plus other documents)
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This communication confains infformation from Rivos Hotel Company that may be confidential. Except for personal use by
the intended recipent. or as exprassly autharized by the sander, any persan who receives this information is prohibited
from disclosing. copying, distributing, andl/or using it. If you have received this communication in error, please
immediately delate it and all copies, and promptly nolify the sender. Mothing in this communication is intended to operate
a8 an slectronie signature under applicable law
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