To:

From: Matalia Molotkova

Sent: Fri 6/23/2 19:26 PM
Subject: Flight for this Sunday

Title: American Express ®

Sorry, change fee is 150.00
Regards,
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

| just booked flight for Karyna she called, but she didn't mention cat.

For fare is non refundable with 200 change fee

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Perfect! Please issue ticket! (This is - She doesn't have cats! That is Karyna! ?77). But

thanks!

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 23, 2017, at 2:08 PM, Natalia Molotkova ‘:_ wrote:

Will be Jet Blue
B6 62 25JUN PBI LGA 09504 1241P

TOTAL FARE - USD 224.20
Is she traveling with cat?

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
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Centurion Relationship Manager
Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Yes, | did. Booking.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

He ha! Have you missed me!? It's been a couple of days! We need a one way coach ticket
for from Palm Beach to NY. There is a 9:50am flight she would like to take. Not t
sure which airport it goes to or what airline! ...l know you can figure that out for us!?

Sent from my iPhone
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