
To: 
From: 
Sent: Mon 
Subject: Re: Ch 

/19/2017
ange for 

6
Jeffrey E.

Yes 

On Mon, Jun 19, 2017 at 10:48 AM wrote: 

We can do the below change for 

AA 936 21JUN STT JFK 240P 701P - $326.36 

SU 103 22JUN JFK SVO 710P 1115A 23JUN - $872.10 

Sent from my iPhone 
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