To:
Cc: Johanna Thuringer{johannathuringer@hotmail.com)
From: Bella Klein

Sent: Mon 6/19/2017 3:07:18 PM
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein

Wire sent $2792.25 = 2500 Euros
Thank you,
Bella

On Jun 19, 2017, at 10-02 AM‘_P wrote:

Hello Johanna. Jeffrey will have our accounting department wire you 2500 euros.
Bella is CC'd here. Can you please let her know your wiring details?

Thanks! Lesley

Sent from my 1Phone
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