To: Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek) ||| GGG

Cc: Lesley Groff[lesley. jee@gmail.com)]

From: Eella Klein

Sent: Fri 7/7/2017 1:32:26 PM

Subject: Re: CC Authorization form for _ {plus other documents)

Dear Enf,

Confirming that i received money. Appreciate your help!
Have a nice weekend.

Thank you,

Bella

On Jun 30, 2017, at 8:53 AM, Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)

= WIDLE:
Dear Bella,

1840 eu.
Best Regards

-----

Belek Mahallesi Kongre Cadd

Rixos Premium Belek Belak /Sarik Ant

Elif Ceylan Phone : +30 (24
Reservation Manager Fae: +90 (242
Mabile : hittp vy
= o T . — — .
N Fa -/ 5 & ' T A - — Y e
F r "-\. -r.- _k‘ 5 B . — - - »

EFTA_R1_00948983
EFTA02218048



Sent: Friday, June 30, 2017 3:46 PM
To: Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)

Subject: Re: CC Authorization form for |GGG (-s other documents)

OK, great. What is the exact amount so i can look for it

Thank you,
Bella

On Jun 30, 2017, at 8:35 AM, Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)

o

Dear Bella,
now | gave Paris bank details.
Best Regards

Rixos Prelum Belek
Elif Ceylan

Reservation Manager

Belok Mahallesi Kongra Cadd

Belek /Serik Antalya Turkey

Phone -
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From: Bella Kiein
Sent: Friday, June 30, 2017 3:24 PM
To: Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)

Subject: Re: CC Authorization form for ||| GGG (o' other documents)

Great, Please let me know what instructions were used.
Thank you,
Bella

On Jun 30, 2017, at 8:21 AM, Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)

o

Dear Bella,
| gave the accounting department information.
It will be refund money as soon as possible.

Best Regards
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Rixos Premium Belek Belek Mahallesi Kongre Cadd

Balek (Serik Antalya Turkey
Elif Ceylan rhene : ||| GG
Raservation Manager I
mosite : [ T Bte:/wwwsisps.com

From: Bella Kiein (N
Sent: Friday, June 30, 2017 3:04 PM
To: Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)

Subject: Re: CC Authorization form for || NN NN (-'us other documents)

On Jun 30. 2017, at 2:36 AM, Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)

I o

Dear Bella,
You can pat euro and we refund money euro. Please send me euro currency iban no.
Best Regards
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Belek Mahallesi Kongre Cadd

Rixos Premium Belek Salek [Serik Antalys Turkey

Elif Ceylan ehon -
Reservation Manager ]
mobils [ bt sixes. com

From: Bella Klein ||
Sent: Thursday, June 29, 2017 5:44 PM
To: Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)
Cc: Lesley Groff

Subject: Re: CC Authorization form for ||| GGG (o'us other documents)

On Jun 29, 2017, at 2:38 AM, Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)

- o

Dear Bella,
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Reservation date has been changed. Please send me new flight details
about airport transfer,

and also send me iban number your bank details about refund your

money.
Best Regadrs

Rixos Premium Belek Belek (Sarik Antalya Turkey e - o

Elif Ceylan T
Reservation Manager I

Muhin:_ it/ e FiDS. com
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From: Bella Klein
Sent: Wednesday, June 28, 2017 11:14 PM
To: Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)
Cc: Lesley Groff; Bella Klein

Subject: Re: CC Authorization form for _ (plus other

documents)

Ehf,
[ would like to let you know that _ changed their

itinerary and will leave Antalya on June 30th morming. Onigimnally
check out date was July 4th. Please 1ssue a credit for 4 mights and
apply it to the Visa card on file.

Thank you,
Bella

On Jun 20, 2017, at 9:20 AM, Lesley Groff
< > wrote:

Oh my. Ok. | will have Bella in our
accounting dept look into this. |
am not sure what is wrong. Thank
you for letting me know. We will
get to the bottom of this.
Appreciate your help. Lesley

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 20, 2017, at 9:09 AM, Elif Ceylan

(Rixos Hotels - Belek
< > wrote:

Dear Lesley,
MNo payment is received from the card. Not
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accepted.

Best Regards

Belek Mahallesi Kongre (

Rixos Premium Belek Belek /Serik Antalya Turkey
Elif Ceylan rhore : |||
Reservation Manager ]
mobie : [ GGG itp:ffwoww rixos. com
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Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 3:39 PM
To: Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels - Belek)
Cc: Bella Klein
Subject: Re: CC Authorization form for
(plus other documents)

On Jun 20, 2017, at 8:33 AM,
Elif Ceylan {Rixos Hotels -

Belek i

wrote:
Dear Lesley,
Please write total amount to form.

Best Regards

Belek Mahalles

Rixos Premium Belek

Belek /Serik Antalys Turkey

Elif Ceylan prone : I
Reservation Manager .
Mabile _ hittp:[fesnw. rixos.com
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Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 3:30 PM

To: Sebla Soydan (Rixos Hotels - CHQ); Elif Ceylan (Rixos Hotels -
Belek)

Cc: Bella Klein

Subject: CC Authorization form for
(plus other documents)

This communication contains information from
Rixgs Hotel Company that may be confidential
Except for personal use by the intended
recipient, or 2% expressly authorized by the
sender, any person who recaives this
information i prohibited from disclosing,
copying. distributing. andior using it. If you have
received this communication in erar, please
immediately delete it and all copies, and
prompily notify the sender. NMothing in this
communication is intended 1o operate as an
electronic signature under applicable law.

This communication contains information from Rixos Hotel
Company that may be confidential. Except for personal use by the
inlended recipient, or as expressly authorized by the sender, any
person who receives this infarmation ks prohibited from disclosing.
copying, distnibuting, and’or using it. If you have received this
communication n eror, please imnmdiabely dadete it and all
copies, and promptly notify the sender. Mothing in this
communication s intended o operate as an electronic signature
under applicable law.
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This cammunication contains information from Rikos Hotel Company that may be confidential. Except
for parsonal use by the intendad recipiant, or as axprassly authorized by the sander, any persan who
receives this information is prohibited from disclosing, copying, distributing, andior using it. If you have
received this communication in emor, please immediately delete it and all copies, and promptly notify
tha sender. Mothing in this communication is intended to operate as an electronic signature under
applicable law

This commaunication contains information from Rikos Hotel Company thal may be confidential. Excepl for personal use by
the intended recipient, or as expressly authorized by the sender, any person who receives this information is prohibited
from disclosing. copying, distributing, and/or using it. If you have received this communication in érror, please
immediately delete it and all copies, and promplly notify the sender. Mothing in this communication is intended to operate
as an electronic signature under applicable taw

This communication contains information from Rixos Hotel Company that may be confidential. Except for personal use by
the intended recipient, or as expressly authorized by the sender, any person who receives this information is prohibited
from desclosing. copying, distributing, and/or using it. If you have recaived this communication in error, pleasa
immediately delete it and all copies, and promplly notify the sender. Mothing in this communication is intended o operate
as an electronic signature under applicable Law

This communication contains information from Rikos Hotel Company that may be confidantial. Except for personal use by
the intended recipient, or as expressly authorized by the sender, any person who receives this information is prohibited
from disclosing. copying, distributing, andf/or using it. If you have received this communication in érror, pleasa
immediately delete it and all copies, and promplly notify the sender. Mothing in this communication is intended to operate
as an electronic signature under applicable Law

This communication contains information from Riwos Hotel Company that may be confidential. Except for personal use by
the intended recipient, or as axprassly autharized by the sender, any person who recenes this information is prohibited
from disclosing. copying, distributing, and/or using it. If you have received this communication in ermor, please
immadiately delete it and all copies, and promplly nolify the sendar. Maothing in this communication is intended o operate
a5 an electronic signature under applicable law
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