
To: 
From: 
Sent Mon 6/19/2017 2:05:28 PM 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

Hi! 

Yes of course! Can you wire to My american account Which u wired before? Do u 
still have the details?! 

Thanks 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Jun 19, 2017, at 4:02 PM, wrote: 

> Hello Jeffrey will have our accounting department wire you 2500 euros. 
Bella is CC'd here. Can you please let her know your wiring details? 

> Thanks! 

> Sent from my iPhone 
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