
To: Bella Klein 
Fran: 
Sent Tue 8/15/2017 5:54:53 PM 
Subject Re: Receipt From Frederic Fekkai - 5th Avenue 

I called...Juan will email me the receipts... 

On Aug 15, 2017, at 1:52 PM, Bella Klein •: :> wrote: 

great 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Aug IS, 2017, at 1:49 PM, 
wrote: 

I can email Patricia at Fekkai. I will include you on the mail 

On Au 15 2017 at 10:38 AM, Bella Klein 
wrote: 

Thanks Les, 2 charges below that i will need backup from Fekkai. Please let 
me know if you will reach out for backup or i should. 
08/03/2017 FREDERIC FEKKAI - NEW YORK, 

NY 
07/25/2017 FREDERIC FEKKAI - NEW YORK, 

NY 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Aug 14, 2017, at 6:19PM,l
wrote: 

this is invoice for me on Jul 663.58 ....I have an invoice for 
from Aug. 1 for $1029.33 (sending 
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to you next)...so is the question on the Aug. 
3rd charge for $912.29? 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Frederic Fekkai - 5th 
Avenue 

Subject: Receipt From 
Frederic Fekkai - 5th 
Avenue 
Date: July 27, 2017 at 

To: 

Receipt attached... 

<Invoice201707271888.PDF> 
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