To:
From:
Sent:
Subject:

[ssue th

Lesley Groff
Tue 8/8/2017 6:23:41 PM
Re: Ticket for

is ticket please! thanks!

On Aug 8.2017_at 2:14 PM. Natalia Molotkova

Lowest rate will be Delta:
1 DL 2358 D1SEF LGA PBI DBD3A 1114A
2 DL 1242 DBSEF PBl LGA 1235P 0329P

TOTAL FARE - USD 259.40

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion RE|3ti0nShii Manaier

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

he is changing dates! Jeffrey says she should go Sept. 1-6...s0 sorry...what is best here...?

On Aug 8, 2017, at 1:55 PM, Natalia Molotkova *:_3- wrote:

OK, non refundable with $150 change fee.

Regards,
Matalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

wow! what a bargain! Issue please!

On Aug 8, 2017, at 1:47 PM, Natalia Molotkova ﬁ_} wrote:

1 B6 461 03SEP LGA PBIO730A 1020A
2 B6 362 10SEP PBI LGA 1206P 0252P
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TOTAL FARE - USD 188.40

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
I S—

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Sure, on it.

Regards,

Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
@

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Please research a ticket for || NN to oo NY-PB-NY Sept. 3-10. what is best price in the market for cc
3rd, afternoon on 10th. ..

thank you! Lesley
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