To:
From:
Sent:

Lesley Groff

Fri 8/252017 2:43: P
Subject: Re: Tickot for NN

super.

..thanks

On Aug 25, 2017, at 10:42 AM, Natalia Molotkova
= = Wrote:

I r=re is non refundable , change fee is EUR70.00. Same for [} Tickets are on its way.

Regards,
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-330PM EST

You may issue the ticket for [JJJl| (ouxsTL) and for | 1QFTI)! Yae...2 down...2 more to go.. gett

On Aug 25, 2017, at 10:06 AM, Natalia Molotkova <_=- wrote:

ok, [ f=re is 959.30, [ - $533.20

Regards,
Matalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

es, this is better...no need to get - on a 7am when she would still connect to the 1010. So the 8:20am
i ..send me reservations so | can get approval...thanks!

On Aug 25, 2017, at 9:56 AM, Natalia Molotkova <} G- ot

We can do

SU 1407 SVX 5VO B20A BIDA
SU 2454 SVO CDG 1010A 105P

Will it work?

EFTA_R1_00955771
EFTA02220369



| don't see anything earlier via Moscow. There is a 7am to Moscow, but connecting flight for - is the &

Regards,
Matalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
e S—

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Re this ticket...| believe we need - and - to depart Moscow early for Paris. . .therefore - must ¢
enough...maybe like a 7am flight from Ekaterinburg to Moscow? possible? then depart Moscow like 9am fc

On Aug 25, 2017, at 9:25 AM, Natalia Molotkova _:* wrote:

oh wow...good question for- ..thanks!

On Aug 25, 2017, at 9:25 AM, Natalia Molotkova <} - - ot-:

1 SU 1411 05SEFP SVX SVO 1200N 1230P
1 SU 2458 05SEP SVO CDG 0205P 0500F

2 sU 2463 07SEP CDG SWVO 0355P 0830P
2 sU 1408 O07SEP SVO SVX 1150P 0410A

TOTAL FARE - USD 720.30

- ask her to double check if she can travel to Europe with one way ticket:
su 2458 055EP SVO CDG 0205P 0500P

TOTAL FARE - USD  463.30

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
@

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

EFTA_R1_00955772
EFTA02220370



all these are COACH tickets. . forgot to specify...

On Aug 25, 2017, at 9:05 AM, Natalia Molotkova _} wrote:

thanks for all!

On Aug 25, 2017, at 9:05 AM, Natalia Molotkova _> wrote:

On it.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationshii Manaier
-@

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

ing! We have several tickets to work on this morning...l will keep all in separate emails for ease. ..
Wwin be traveling from Ekaterinburg (Russia), going through Moscow to Paris_Will you please see if sl
book our on the same flight as from Moscow to Paris (JJlij is in Moscow now)
around 4pm. { will stay in Paris)

P Expires:

you have her in our profile.. let me know if you need anything
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