From:
Sent: Thur 824/2017 7:01:38 PM
Subject: Re: Next

Yes

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 24, 2017, at 2:16 PM, Richard Kahn _ Wrote:

can you please put this call on jee calendar
thank vou

Begin forwarded message:

From: Richard Kahn <[ GGG

Subject: Re: Next
Date: August 24, 2017 at 2:11:12 PM EDT

next tuesday 1:30pm est is confirmed
thank you

On Aug 24, 2017, at 1:27 PM, Heather MacGregor

Unfortunately, Neale and Chris are unavailable today or tomorrow so
wondering if we could confirm Tues, 8/29 @ 1:30 pm ET
tor this call?

Hi Richard:

Please let me know if that works and [ will send around a calendar invite.

Thanks!
Heather

From: Richard Kahn [mailto
Sent: Thursday, August 24, 2
To: Neale Attenborough

Cc: Chris Lawler; Heather MacGregor
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Subject: Re: Next

Can we set up a call for today or tomorrow?
Please advise
Thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRK. Associates Inc

On Aug 22, 2017, at 3:30 PM,
Richard Kahn

wrote:

nice talking with you both earlier

did claxon receive 609k from nulan in 20097 if not sure who
should I direct that question to?

also please send balance sheet and cash flow information thank
you

Richard Kahn
HBEK Associates Inc.

On Aug 22, 2017,
at 1:00 PM,
Richard Kahn
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