
To: 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: Fwd: Refund Aeroflot for D. Burak 

Bella Klein 

Fri 9/15/2017 6:40:56 PM 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Natalia Molotkova" 
Subject: Refund Aeroflot for D. Burak 
Date: Se tember 15, 2017 at 2:38:23 PM EDT 
To: 
Reply-To: "Natalia Molotkova" er > 

Business class ticket for Burak D. was refunded: 

SABRE TICKET RECORD 
INV:0136033 CUST:0000342129 PNR:TGBEWA 
TKT:5558652347714 ISSUED:06SEP2017PHX PCC:Z8B0 IATA:03531500 
NAME:BURAK/DARIA FF: SU237757785 
FOP: 
CPN FLT CLS DATE BRDOFF TIME ST F/B STAT 
1 SU 1307 D 08SEP OVBSVO 925A OK DCO RFND 
2 SU 2462 D 08SEP SVOCDG 1145A OK DCO RFND 

FARE EUR1026.00 TAX 151.90YQ TAX 11.20RI 
TOTAL USD1384.10 EQUIV FARE PD USD1221.00 

COMM: .00 

Refund amount is $1300.10 ( ticket value $1384.10, minus refund fee $84.00). Might take up to two billing cy 
Will refund $84.00 on my end. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

ours: on 

eimissisis 

t rough day 9AM-530PM  EST 
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