From:
Sent: Tue 8M19/2017 6:59:38 PM
Subject: Re: Ticket for Marilyn FLORES!

very good!
On Sep 19, 2017, at 2:51 PM, Natalia Molotkova

Wrote:

Ok, non refundable tickets.

Regards,
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relation Shii Man EIiEI‘

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-330PM EST

YES! Please issue! thank you!

On Sep 19, 2017, at 2:49 PM, Natalia Molotkova _ wrote;

BE 461 20SEP LGA PBI 730A 1025A - $138.20
DL2395 26SEP PBILGA T7235A 10304 - $83.20.

Ok to issue?

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

can we get her back earier than the 12:36...arrive more like the 10:25am time frame...sorry

On Sep 19, 2017, at 2:42 PM, Matalia Malutkﬂu_ wrote:

itis...

On Sep 19, 2017, at 2:39 PM, Natalia Molotkova - =
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1 BB 461 S 20SEP W LGA PBI 0730A 1025A
2 BB 62 P 26SEPT PBI LGA 0953A 1236P

TOTAL FARE - USD 196.40
OK to issue? Mon refundable coach with $150 change fee.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relation Shii Man aier

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Ok, on it. So, her home is in FL?
Regards,

Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

jet blue#461 flight departs tomorrow at 7:30am arrives PBI at 10:25am

On Sep 19, 2017, at 2:18 PM, Natalia Molotkova <G ot

| have permission for Marilyn to go home tomorrow morning...might there be a flight from LGA around 8am?
though super price...

On Sep 19, 2017, at 2:18 PM, Matalia Molotkova _ wrote:

Ok, changing.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

getting permission for her to leave tomorrow morning...hang tight...
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she has too much to do here! I'll be back to you

On Sep 19, 2017, at 2:04 PM, Natalia Molotkova ::_e:

WAIT!!! she wants to leave tomorrow morning...too much traffic etc..
leave tomorrow early from LGA

sorry!
On Sep 18, 2017, at 1:57 PM, Natalia Molotcova ST .-

1 AA 2064 B 26SEP T PBI LGA 0830A 0132P
1ADT 87.30 87.30

TOTAL FARE -USD 87.30

DL2393V 265EP T PBILGA 551 735A 1030A

Also $83.20
Regards,

Natalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

!nurs: Hﬂn t!rﬂug! !fl!ay !H—!LGPM EST

yes, great!

holy cow! No you can't! but just asking, is there a earlier flight for el cheapo also? maybe like 8am ish

Return Jet Blue - can't bit that

1 BB 62 P 26S5EP T PBI LGA 0953A 1236P
1ADT 5820 58.20

TOTAL FARE - USD 58.20 PRIVATE

Regards,
Matalia (Natasha) Molotkova
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Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Ok, issuing outbound as one way United, fate is $138.20.
Checking return.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

that would be better...
either airline fine...
keep price tight...

N

On Sep 19, 2017, at 1:54 PM, Natalia Molotkova «:_ wrote:

OK, non refundable change fee is 200.00. | can book return with different airline, Delta or Jet Blue to LGA?

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

ok forget it...if that is the latest out of LGA we can't make it...she will take the flights from Mewark...please is

On Sep 19, 2017, at 1:52 PM, Natalia Mmlnthcva_wmte:

1 DL 2852 T19SEP T LGA PBI 0430P OT45P

2 DL 2395 V 26SEP T PBI LGA 0735A 1030A
1ADT 26140 26140

TOTAL FARE - USD  261.40

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relatinnshii Manaier
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!nurs: Hﬂn t!mugh Friday 9AM-530PM EST

wait, that is Newark though...anything out of LGA?

On Sep 19, 2017, at 1:47 PM, Matalia Molotkova

perfect! Please issue

On Sep 19, 2017, at 1:47 PM, Matalia Molotkova <

we need a later flight please...tonight .. .like 9pm...the retumn is fine..

Wrote:

wrote:

On Sep 19, 2017, at 1:46 PM, Natalia Molotkova |GGG ' rote:

1 UA 1679 G 19SEP T EWR PBI 0910P 1159P
2 UA 1861 G 265EFP T PBI EWR 0705A 0951A

1ADT 236.40 236.40
TOTAL FARE - USD  236.40

Regards,
Matalia (Natasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

1 DL 2852 T19SEP T LGA PBI 0430P O745P

2 DL 2395 V 265EP T PBI LGA 0735A 1030A
1ADT 26140 26140

TOTAL FARE - USD  261.40

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relatinnshii Manaier

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-330PM EST

thanks

On Sep 19, 2017, at 1:31 PM, Natalia Molotkova _ wrote:
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On it!!!

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

We need a ticket for Marilyn FLORES (she was Fabro...got her citizenship and is now Flores -her husbands

She should depart NY tonight (LGA preferred) to Palm Beach...and return to NY on Tues. Sept. 26th in the m
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