
To: Luciano Fontanilla 
Cc: Bella Klein( 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Mon 9/18/2017 10:34:16 PM 
Subject: Re: bentley tire 

ok 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 

> On Sep 18, 2017, at 6:31 PM, Luciano Fontanilla 
wrote: 

> It's fix there's a screw that's whyit's flat paid $20.00 

> • Sent from my iPhone 

» On Sep 18, 2017, at 6:27 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

>> can you please update me on how we got flat? who repaired? cost? etc.. 
» thank you 
>> 
» Richard Kahn 
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