
To: 
From: 
Sent Tue 7/25/2017 2:44:20 PM 
Subject: Re: Invoices 

Kevin, 

I am not sure if payment will be end of the month, apparently the fine for the trees was 
HUGE... 

On Jul 24, 2017, at 12:51 PM, Kevin Ouvre wrote: 

One last thing sorry, 
Regarding my invoices do you know whether they would be treated for this end month? 

Best regards, 

Kevin. 
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