
To: 
Cc: Richard Kahn 
Fran: Bella Klein 
Sent Fri 9/29/2017 5:17:16 PM 
Subject: Re: jee 6000 euros 

Euros ready for pickup 
Thank you, 
Bella 

> 

> 

on Sep 29, 2017, at 1:10 PM, 

yes... 

wrote:

» On Sep 29, 2017, at 1:03 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote:
>> 
» 
» 
» 

jee asked for 6000 euros for paris.. 
can you both coordinate jojo or leo pickup of money today 
thank you 

» Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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