
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: Bella Kiel 
From: 
Sent Thur 10/12/2017 4:14:28 PM 
Subject Re: christies 

OK! I just spoke to someone in office...seems to me Jeffrey has purchased some items 
but whatever name (entity?) he is using does not match the credit card (or something along these 
lines) just sent an email that Rich should call JE first...I still believe you will need to 
Please call tomorrow (they are open 9-5 London time) and speak with her re payment... 

On Oct 12, 2017, at 12:07 PM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

ok 
thank you 
bella can you please call and if you need to patch me in on cell 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Oct 12, 2017, at 11:36 AM, 
wrote: 

Hmmm. Yesterday I received a call from Marie at Christies in Paris. She wanted r 
speak to JE Re the Pinto sale. But that is all I know! 

0113340768410 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 12, 2017, at 11:19 AM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

do you know what this is? 
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Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

<Fireoemv a: ciaetffi ornl E."cim a corn>

Date: October 12 2017 at 
EDT 
To:a ' hard Kahn 

11:17:03AM 

Christie's call re diffemt cos name 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail,com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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