From: Lesley

Sent: Mon 10/2/2017 8:21:54 PM
Subject: Re: OK to Purchase Ticket for [

on Oct 2, 2017, at 4:13 PM, [ 5 - - -

Thank you so much Sneaky and Lesley!

On Mon, Oct 2, 2017 at 4:05 PM jeffrey E. <jeevacation@ gmail com™> wrote:

et
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o

On Mon, Oct 2, 2017 at 3:59 PM, Lesley Groff <} N ' rotc:

- requesting below ticket.. .OK to purchase?

TOTAL FARE - U
S

TOTAL FARE -USD 203.20

Total $418.56

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chient privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

sincerely | NS

EFTA_R1_00970612
EFTA02226447



