
To: 
Cc: Larry Visosk 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Sat 10/21/2017 11:39:24 PM 
Subject: Re: FINAL TRIP SHEET OCT. 22ND 

was there a cancellation fee? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Oct 21, 2017, at 5:51 PM 

thank you very much...so sorry... 

wrote: 

n t 21 2017 t 5:49 PM, iffy Heliflite Scheduling & Dispatch 
wrote: 

Hi Lesley, 

Not a problem. We will cancel the flight. 

Kazi Islam 

Scheduling, Dispatch and Charter 
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About HeliFlite: 

• 11 Executive Cabin Class Helicopters 
• Twin Engine 
• Dual Piloted 
• Wyvern Recommended 
• ARG/US Platinum Rated 
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Based at EWR and Downtown Chicago 
<image002.png><image003.png> 

From: 
Sent: Saturday, October 21, 2017 5:43 PM 
To: ifly Heliflite Scheduling & Dispatch 
Cc: Larry Visoski Larry a; Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: FINAL TRIP SHEET OCT. 22ND 

' CAUTION - EXTERNAL EMAIL *** 
I am so very sorry, but Jeffrey has just requested we cancel this trip! 
Please confirm back receipt of this cancellation. 

Thank you, 

Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein 

On Oct 21, 2017, at 4:50 PM, ifly Heliflite Scheduling & 
Dispatch .4 2. wrote: 

Please see the final trip sheets attached for tomorrow Sunday 
Oct. 22n°. 

Best, 

Tatiana L. Morillo 

Scheduling, Dispatch and Charter 
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<Heliflite Final Trip Sheet.pdf> 

*** DO NOT open attachments or click on links from 
unknown senders or unexpected/suspicious looking 
emails *** 
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