To: Faith Kates

From:

Sent: Tue 1072472017 9:05:48 PM
Subject: Re: US Open

Rich will make sure this is paid tomorrow!

Sent from my iPhone
On Oct 24, 2017, at 4:14 PM, Faith Karcs_wmre:

thanks

From:
Sent: Tuesday, October 24, 2017 4:12 PM
To: Faith Kates
Subject: Re: US Open

HI Faith...I will check in to this with the accounting department! thanks, -

On Oct 24, 2017, at 3:40 PM, Faith Kates

From: Vijay Paul
Sent: Tuesday, October 24, 201
To: Faith Kates
Subject: RE: US Open

Hello Faith,

Thank you again for your purchase of these US Open tickets — | just
wanted to follow up because we hadn't received a check and |
wanted to make sure it hadn’t been lost in the mail. As a reminder
the total was 52,800 for the four tickets. Please let me know if you
have any questions, thank you!

Vijay Paul

Senior Manager of Business Development
JTCC

5200 Campus Drive | College Park, MD 20740

From: Vijay Paul
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Sent: Friday, September 01, 2017 3:21 PM
To: Faith Kates

Cc: Ray Benton

Subject: RE: US Open

Thank you very much Faith, see attached invoice for the tickets, total
52,800,

The tickets have either already been delivered or will be within the hour.

Please make check payable to JTCC and mail to:

ITCC

cfo Vijay Paul

2200 Campus Drive
College Park, MD 20740

Vijay Paul
Senior Manager of Business Development
ITCC

5200 Campus Drive | College Park, MD 20740

From: Faith Kates
Sent: Friday, September 1, 2017 3:14 PM
To: Vijay Paul
Cc: Ray Benton
Subject: Re: US Open

Please send me by email a bill for the tots so jeffrey can send a check
And the address where to send it

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 1, 2017, at 1:55 PM, Vijay Paul_wrote:

We can deliver this afternoon

Vijay Paul
Senior Manager of Business Development
JTCC

5200 Campus Drive | College Park, MD 20740

From: Faith Kates |

Sent: Friday, September 1, 2017 1:29 PM
To: Vijay Paul
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Cc: Ray Benton
Subject: Re: US Open

When will you deliver?

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 1, 2017, at 11:30 AM, Vijay Paul ||| ENNENENGEE

wrote:

Ok what name is it under?

Vijay Paul
Senior Manager of Business Development
ITCC

5200 Campus Drive | College Park, MD 20740

From: Faith Kates

Sent: Friday, September 1, 2017 11:22 AM
To: Vijay Paul

Cc: Ray Benton

Subject: Re: US Open

0 east 71stit's a town house let me know when
they will be delivered

Sent from my iPhone
On Sep 1, 2017, at 11:00 AM, Vijay Paul

rote;

¥Yes no problem, let us know the
name and address for delivery

Vijay Paul

Senior Manager of Business
Development

ITCC

5200 Campus Drive | College Park,

MD 20740

From: Faith Kates

Sent: Friday, September 1, 2017 10:59 AM
To: Vijay Paul
Cc: Ray Benton
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Subject: Re: US Open

Sent from my iPhone

Ok for now they just want 4 tickets
for Tuesday day courtside

Please confirm and can you deliver
them?

On 5ep 1, 2017, at 10:49 AM, Vijay

Hello Faith,

To make things
simpler, here are two
great courtside
options for those

SEes5i0ns:

s Tues, Sept5S
day—-21G, 4
seats, total =
52,800
(51,000 is
the
charitable
portion)

*  ‘Wed, Septé
eve — 20H, 4
seats, total =
59,600
(56,200 is
the
charitable
portion)

Vijay Paul

Senior Manager of
Business Development
ITCC

2200 Campus Drive |
College Park, MD
20740

From: Ray Benton
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Sent: Friday, September 1, 2017 10:44 AM
To: Faith Kates; Vijay Paul
Subject: RE: US Open

Faith, this is a list of
all types of tickets
available for sale for
the sessions you
requested.

Raymond S.
Benton

CEO

JTCC

5200 Campus
Drive

College Park, MD
20740

From: Faith Kates

Sent: Friday, September 01, 2017 10:34 AM
To: Vijay Paul

Cc: Ray Benton

Subject: Re: US Open

What does this mean

Sent from my iPhone
On Sep 1, 2017, at
10:03 AM, Vijay Paul

wrote:

Good
maornin
g Faith,

Ray
forward
ed on
your
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messag
e—-we
still
have a
good
amount
of
tickets
for
Tues
day and
Wed
eve
includin
gd
seats in
a
courtsi
de box.
What
would
be the
best
way to
procee
d?
Thank
you!l

Session Date Day/Ev Category
]

517 Tues, Sept Day Ashe Prestige
5 Courtside

517 Tues, Sept Day Ashe Rear Courtsi
5

517 Tues, Sept Day Ashe Lower Court
5

517 Tues, Sept Day Ashe Courtside
5
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517 Tues, Sept Day Ashe Lower Loge
5

517 Tues, Sept Day Ashe Loge
5

517 Tues, Sept Day Armstrong Cnurts'
5

520 Wed, Sept Eve Ashe Prestige
6 Courtside

520 Wed, Sept | Eve | Ashe Rear Courtsi
<]

s20 Wed, Sept Eve Ashe Lower Court
&

520 Wed, Sept Eve Ashe Courtside
6

520 Wed, Sept Eve Ashe Lower Loge
&

520 Wed, Sept Eve Ashe Loge
6

520 Wed, Sept Eve Ashe Prumenadel
<]

Vijay
Paul
Senior
Manage
r of
Business
Develop
ment
JTCC
5200
Campus
Drive |
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<Kates, Faith (9-1-17).pdf>
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