
Thank you, 
Bella 

To: Lesley Groff 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent Mon 10/16/2017 10:17:04 PM 
Subject: Re: I need to pay for a hotel in Riga 

Hope u received 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Oct 16, 2017, at 6:15 PM, Lesley Groff < =.> wrote: 

for some reason, I did not receive...I just double checked all emails sent from you 
today...nothing with the date of expiration for the card...agree good to keep 
separate.. 
can you send again or send tomorrow to me if you gone for the day! ;) 

On Oct 16, 2017, at 6:13 PM, Bella Klein ‹ > 
wrote: 

I emailed in a different email as did want complete info in one email.. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Oct 16, 2017, at 5:57 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

Hi Bella...I can't send the form to the hotel until you 
give me the expiration date of the Visa...can you send to 
me please? 

On Oct 16 2017 at 10:25 AM, Bella Klein 
wrote: 
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On Oct 16, 2017, at 10:20 AM, 
Lesley Groff 

wrote: 

Hi Bella...I need to fill out a 3rd part CC Authorization form 
for stay at 
the Pullman Riga Old Town 
hotel Nov. 2-11. They only 
accept Visa or Mastercard. Can 
you please provide me the card 
information you would like me 
to usc? 

Thanks, Lesley 

Hotel 
Address 

Telephone 
Check In Date 
Check Out Date 
Confirmation Number 
Total 

Cancellation Policy 
Confirmed 

PULLMAN RIGA OLD TOWN 
Jekaba lela 24 
RIGA LV LV 1050 
371-67815444 
Thu 02 Nov 2017 
Sat 11 Nov 2017 
9619RK1516 
EUR 1325.00 
May be subject to local taxes, 
service charges, and daily resort 
fees if applicable 
Cancel By 2 Pm Day Of Arrival 
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