o I

From: jeffrey E.
Sent: Tue 10/31/2017 5:33:47 PM
Subject: Re: Krauss/Villa Retreat Reservation April 5-9,2018

ves , make it for 6 7 . ask for agenda and schedule unlikely i cam make it more than two

nights.

On Tue, Oct 31, 2017 at 1:19 PM., —} wrote:

Re renting "The Villa Retreat” for the Krauss 10 Year Anniversary, please confirm you wish
me to rent for the dates of Apnl 5-9, 2018.. .1 must pay for one night plus tax ($4500) and it 15

NON Refundable. OK to do so?
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