From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Mon 11/6/2017 3:32:56 PM
Subject: Re: Flight to Russia

great. thanks

On Nov 6, 2017, at 10:22 AM. Natalia Molotkova

OK, non refundable coach with EUR 100.00 change fee. Ticket is on its way.

Regards,

Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
eenturion.com

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Jeffrey has approved .. .please issue the ticket.

On Nov €, 2017, at 9:52 AM, Natalia Molotkova {_3- wrote:

| will come back to you...let me get approval..

On Nov 6, 2017, at 9:52 AM, Natalia Molotkova <[ G- ot

Will be:
1 SU 103 10NOV JFK SWVO 0720P 1225P
1 SU 1212 11NOV SWO KUF 0225P 0510P

2 5U 1211 20NOV KUF SVO 1155A 1240P
2 sU 102 20NOV SVO JFK 0235P 0515P

TOTAL FARE - USD 598.76
OK to issue?

Regards,

Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager
{@centurion.com

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-330PM EST

Booking.
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Regards,
Natalia_ (Mata shfa} Mollﬂtkuva

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST
Thank you for your email. | am currently out of the office.

Morning Natasha...can you please reserve this ticket for - - and let me know the price?

Could you please book me a flight from NYC to Samara and back. | ve attached the exact flight inform
me know if you have any questions.

Thank you in advance,
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