
To: 
Fran: 
Sent 
Subject Re: Velar Call 

Fri 11/10/2017 2:40:00 PM 

perfect...thanks Rich...and sorry on the time...I guess he wants more time with his lunch 
meeting! 

On Nov 10, 2017, at 9:09 AM, Richard Kahn ‹ > 
wrote: 

i will get them on the phone 240 or so then patch in jee 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Nov 10, 2017, at 8:11 AM, 
wrote: 

Great. Is there a dial in number? Or will you call JE with Valar? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 10, 2017, at 8:07 AM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

2:15pm is confirmed for today 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK A i 1 In . 
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On Nov 10, 2017, at 8:02 AM > wrote: 

At the moment yes! Will try to keep that 
way 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 10, 2017, at 6:4 ' 
wrote: 

i sent email asking for either of 
those times but have not yet 
heard back.. 
are they both still available? 
please advise 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates • 

On Nov 9, 2017 at 
3:16 PM 

Jeffrey has a lunch tomorrow at 1pm 
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Would 12:30pm or 2:15pm work for the call? 

On 
Nov 9, 
2017, 
at 2:54 
PM, 
Richar 
d Kahn 

> 
wrote: 

how is tomorrow at 1pm? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc 
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