To: Natalia Mnlothuva[centurion.com]

From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Tue 10/31/2017 2:29:57 PM
Subject: Re: Tickets NY to PB this Friday Nov. 3

Ok. Thanks. Will come back to you

Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 31, 2017, at 10:27 AM, Natalia Molotkova ‘-_'_c-!_-;_‘f[lT%l]'[t'lﬂ COm> wrote:

We can do Delta from La Guardia at 310pm or United at 410p from EWR. Jet Blue has
flight also at 559p from EWR.

Regards,

Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST
lets look at other airlines then...anything departing NY around 4pm?
On Oct 31, 2017 at 10:02 AM, Natalia Molotkova

“—@.E?.D.t..&'.ii}?!..r.‘..-.FE.';*_EE'? wrote:

Lesley, direct | have only Jet Blue departure at 159pm or 8pm, nothing in between. The rest
will be connection. OK to price 159pm?

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST
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y, coach tickets departing NY around 4pm going to PB for
(who already has a ticket Rec. Loc#KIOHZP) and another
o | need to get details for) Can you let me know what our options
already has Jet Blue ticket, let me know if option is there...and

girl named
are? Considering
price..thanks!
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