
To: Peggy Siega 
From: 
Sent: Thur 11/9/2017 6:45:04 PM 
Subject: Re: Peggy's Birthday Gift 

HI Rebecca....so odd...I don't' see ever receiving this original email?! I just checked back?...did 
I answer you? oh wait! I was flying to Phoenix, AZ last Thursday...I wonder if that had 
something to do with it...bottom line though, I will let Jeffrey know Peggy is asking... 

On Nov 9, 2017, at 1:29 PM, Rebecca Drescher an> 
wrote: 

Hi 
I jus wan ed to check in on this! 

Best, 
Rebecca 

From: Rebecca Drescher 
Sent: Thursday, November 02, 2017 5:52 PM 
To: 
Subject: Peggy's Birthday Gift 

Hi 
Peggy wanted me to check in as she would like to know how Jeffrey would like to handle the last 

portion of her $30k birthday gift. 

She has a few more apartment renovation bills and was wondering how Jeffrey would like to 
handle...perhaps through wire transfer? If so, her accountant can send the bank details. 

Let me know what you guys think! 

Best, 
Rebecca Drescher 
illSgy Siegal 
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