To: ginf[jeevacation@gmail.com)
From:

Sent: Fri 11/17/2017 5:31:28 PM

Subject: ALCC-120

I am waiting for Anna to get back to me with her reference number she should have received
when she applied for ALCC.. the man I spoke to cannot find her name in the system. He did tell
me the price of an 1 20 is $2012 for the first 3 months...1 am still waiting to find out how long the
[ 20 takes to issue...l have called the school 7 times and the agents I need to speak to are on the

phone...I am on top of this and wanted you to know...

On Nov 17, 2017, at 8:51 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacationf@gmail.com> wrote:

ALCC. M this is the enghish language school that anna in paris would hke to join | get
an | 20 issued and get a visa shes russian but staying in paris. please call the
schoool and find out how long if we pay today for them to issue the 1 20.
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