
To: Jeffrey Epsteinueevacationagmall.comj 
Fran: Lesley Groff 
Sent Sun 57 PM 
Subject Re: 

New round trip ticket Miami/Moscow/Miami is $1057.94 (I purchased fully refundable..non 
refundable was $719.90) The original ticket on Swiss Air we unfortunately receive no credit for 
since she used the first legs and due to restrictions.... 

On Nov 19, 2017, at 5:59 PM, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

no leave it , just get the round trip miami moscow 

On Sun, Nov 19, 2017 at 5:50 PM, Lesley Groff ‹ > wrote: 

-The current ticket we are holding for is only a return to Moscow. I am 
changing this to a direct flight from Miami to Moscow on Aeroflot on Tues. Nov. 
21. (we will have a credit with Swiss Air for her) 
-I will need to purchase a whole new ticket Moscow to PB on Jan 28th returning 
to where in Switzerland on Feb. 4? Geneva? 

On Nov 19, 2017, at 5:14 PM, jeffrey E. leevacationagmail.com>
wrote: 

book the non stop to moscow for on tuesday return ing jan 28. and change 
her return to switz for feb 4 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jtevacatioila umail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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