To: Lesley Groff]
Cc: David Mitchell

From: Denise Luna
Sent: Fri 11M17/2017 4:17:22 PM
Subject: RE: VIP stay

Denise Luna

General Manager

19 West 31+ Streat

Mew Yark, MY 10001

W lifehotel_com

@lifehotelnewyork @lifehotedmnmy
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From: Lesley Groff [ NN
Sent: Friday, November 17_2017 11:12 AM

To: Denise Luna <= >
Ce: David Mitchell <
Subject: Re: VIP stay

would it be possible for her to have a late check out? Her car service is not picking her up until
3:45pm from the hotel...I realize this is late, but any amount more time would be super...

On Nov 17, 2017, at 11:01 AM, Denise Luna _ wrote:

You're welcome it is our pleasure, Please let me know if you need assistance with
anything.

Thanks,

Denise Luna

General Manager

-
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W: lifehotel com
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From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Friday, November 17, 2017 7:46 AM
To: Denise Luna < =
Cc: David Mitchell <
Subject: Re: VIP stay

Thank you BOTH very much.

Sent from my 1Phone

On Nov 17, 2017, at 7:44 AM, Denise Luna <} | |GGG ot

Thank you Dawvid, reservation is confirmed.

Confirmation #: _

Ihank you

denise Luna

|.1."'|\'I'.|' \1.|I'-.!-:'_-.'I'

Life Hotel
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Mew York, NY 10001

---—---- Ongmal message --------

From: David Mitchell _

Date: 11/17/17 7:26 AM (GMT-05:00)
To: Demse Luna _
Ce: Lestey o -

Subject: VIP stay
Good morning
[ nced a VIP room like 1004 or something in the King Deluxe for

She is my guest so no payment collected
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Please let me know,

Also duplicate confirm to Leshe above

Thank you so much,

Dawvid

DAVID MITCHELL

Mitchell Holdings LLC
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