T Lesiey Grort

From: jeffrey E.
Sent: Thur 11/30/2017 5:39:18 PM
Subject: Re: Flight for Johanna

not yet. but show it to her

On Thu, Nov 30, 2017 at 12:31 PM, Lesley Gmf’f— wrote:

Flight forj 8. Plcase advise if I should purchase:
1 DY 7006 20DEC JFK ARN 1030P 1150A
2 DY 7005 10JAN ARN JFK 0555P 0830F

TOTAL FARE-USD 993.06

please note
The information corltained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chent privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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