
To: 
From: 
Sent Wed 11/29/2017 1:44:40 PM 
Subject: Re: Dinner Paris 

I will try. 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Nov 29, 2017, at 8:36 AM, wrote: 

Hi-, 

> I will coordinate with the girls! Will you be able to do the res and the 
payment through Amex? 
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