
To: Bella Klein 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Wed 12/6/2017 4:22:41 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Your card has been linked by MD PLLC 

you will see a charge from Dr. for $3603.16 on Amex (for me!) 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Square alliliMillea 
Subject: Your card has been linked by 
Date: December 5, 2017 at 1:32:57 PM EST 
To: 

Hello Lesley, 

Amex Has Been Saved 

MD PLLC 

Your Amex was saved on file and authorized to be used for 

future transactions at MD PLLC. 

To change or cancel your payment method, please contact 

MD PLLC using the information below. Visit your card 

dashboard to view all locations your saved card is available at, or 

remove your card on file. 

MD PLLC 
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