
To: 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: Re: Ticket for 

Fri 12/1/2017 9:49:43 PM 

OK, she wants to do: 
depart late on Dec. 27 ( I 0:30pm arrive I I:50am) with a return Jan. 10 at 5:55pm arrive 
8:30pm. Norwegian Air flights....price $65 I? 

On Dec 1 2017 at 4:36 PM Natalia Molotkova 
> wrote: 

There are no over night flights from Europe to US. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationshia Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

she is asking if she can return on the 10th evening and arrive on 11th in NY...possible? 

On Dec 1, 2017, at 3:13 PM, Natalia Molotkova ≥ wrote: 

yikes...no I don't think so.. 

On Dec 1, 2017, at 3:53 PM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

Earlier flight will be Scandinavian Air at 555p from EWR. Price will be triple. OK to issue DY? 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

and yes, I see now you DID have the proper outbound date! oops on my end! 

>On Dec 1, 2017, at 3:13 PM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 
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she is asking if there is an earlier flight on the 27th.. 

On Dec 1, 2017, at 3:13 PM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

It is 27th: 
NORWEGIAN AIR flight DY 7006, coach, 27DEC JFK (New York) ARN (Stockholm) 1030P 1150A 28DEC 
• Inbound -
NORWEGIAN AIR flight DY 7005, coach 12JAN ARN (stockholm) JFK (New York) 555P 830P 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

this says Dec. 28...can she fly out on Dec. 277 

On Dec 1, 2017, at 3:09 PM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to change. 
• Total air reservation, including taxes and fees: $697.96. 
• Non-refundable, $130.00 (per coupon, round trip willb e $260.00) change penalty plus difference in fare. 
• Outbound -
NORWEGIAN AIR flight DY 7006, coach, 27DEC JFK (New York) ARN (Stockholm) 1030P 1150A 28DEC 
• Inbound -
NORWEGIAN AIR flight DY 7005, coach 12JAN ARN (stockholm) JFK (New York) 555P 830P 

Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

do 12th.. 
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On Dec 1, 2017, at 2:50 PM, Natalia Molotkova 

Same price to come back on the 10th or 12th - $697.96. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Sure, on it. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

> wrote: 

HI Natasha...I know the ticket we had for expired last night...which is fine because she can't go to 
on round trip, coach Dec. 27 NY to Stockho m an return on Jan. 10, 11 or 12...whichever has best price... 

Rec Loc # that expired is PLMQPF 

Thanks_ 
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