
To: 
From: 
Sent Wed 11/29/2017 4:22:42 PM 
Subject Re: Dinner Paris 

Super! thank you! 
I dont think so!... 

On Nov 29, 2017, at 11:21 A wrote: 

I spoke to both Valdson and - is there anything else I can do? 

On Wed, Nov 29, 2017 at 9:59 AM wrote: 

Hind Valdson. Jeffrey would like Valdson to give 400 euros so she 
can go to dinner with her 2 friends-please tell we could not pay for the 
Restaurent. She can take the 400 euros and pay for the dinner as Jeffreys treat! 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Nov 29, 2017, at 8:36 A/a wrote: 

> Hi M, 

> I will coordinate with the girls! Will you be able to do the res and the payment through 
Amex? 
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