
To: Jeffrey Epsteinheevacation@gmail.com] 
Cc: Julia Santo 

rem: 
Sent Sat 12/30/2017 2:28:21 PM 
Subject Flight for 

Flight for confirmed. As soon as I have ticket I will forward to. 
School paid for with Flywire.com as the invoice requested. 

On Dec 30, 2017, at 8:19 AM, Jeffrey E. leevacation@cmail.com> wrote: 

plese organzie and pay for the flights for and school in london. thnx 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
.TEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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