To: Bella Klein
Cc: Lesley Groff

From: Larry Visoski
Sent: Thur 11/30/2017 4:55:49 PM
Subject: Re: CAROSA - Transaction Receipt for $321.00

Bella, I agree they have raise the rates and past months, ['ve used this company for many years,
all their drivers be good English the cars are clean and | can give them 30 minute notice and they
show up, most of the time Jeffrey tells me at the last minute he wants a car for a passenger, they
are always there When I need them,,

Maybe you should call Teresa and see if you could work out a corporate discount for us since
we've done business with them in the past other companies like Teterboro Limo are not the most
reliable and equal pricing

CARosa knows our operation, knows the FBO and knows New York City so | never have to
worry when they pick up a passenger for Jeffrey that they will arrive at the right place when they
say they will

Tereasa 1s a very nice lady Maybe she were work a special rate for you?

Just a thought

Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 30, 2017, at 10:05 AM, Bella Klein - GGG - otc:

Crazy rates.. Is it the only company that we can usc for transportation to Newark
Thank you,
Bella

On Nov 30, 2017, at 10:01 AM, Larry Visoski -1*

wrote:

Hi Les,,,

I ordered an extra Car for Elina And Assya.,,

Then I got another Car for Dave and I to take us to Newark,,

That charge was a pilot car, and should have been put on my amx,,,
Hope this clears up you question,,

Total 2 JE cars and 1 pilot car,,,

Thx
Larry
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Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 30, 2017, at 9:40 AM, Lesley Groff *-'_3?* wrote:

Hi Larry...we know Ramon Alonso (the architect) had a
car take him to his hotel when JE flew in on Sunday
26th. ...who was this car for? Jojo picked up JE...7..

On Nov 30, 2017, at 9:37 AM. Bella Klein
< = wrote:

Les,

Who 1s the passenger, the first one 1s Raimon Alonso..
Thank you,

Bella

On Nov 30, 2017, at 5:16 AM,
Lesley Groft
- ot

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: CARosa

Limo

Date: November 30, 2017 at 1:12:46 AM EST

To: Lesley Groff <G

Subject: Fwd: CAROSA - Transaction Receipt for
$321.00

Lesley,
I have enclosed
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Thanks for your business!!

Teresa Goodyear
CARosa Limo LLC,
(Teterboro Airport)

-======-== FOorwarded message -----=----
From: <DoNotReply@billing-notificat

the receipt for
SUV #2 for tail
#120]E

100, com=

Date: Thu, Nov 30, 2017 at 12:18 AM

Subject: CAROSA - Transaction Rece
To: bookings(@ carosalimo.com

ipt for $321.00

CARosa Limo
401 Industrial Ave, Teterboro, NJ

o, T L P LT TN M T S 8 axa

Based @ Signature Flight Support TEB

Term ID: 001

Sale - Approved

Date: 11/30/17 Time: 00:12:27
Card Type: American Express Time Zone: EST
Entry Method: Manual
Customer Ref. 11/26

Tail #N120JE

SUvV
#
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2 TEB/NYC45min/Stop

ltem Qty Amount Total Amount

Base Amount $267.50

Tip $53.50
Amount $321.00

| agree to pay the above total amount according to the card
issuer agreement. (Merchant agreement if credit voucher)

<5A1F933EBOC25EC41112D124C7287011
BC8654FC-sig.png>

Customer Copy
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